
6472-21-001













Control:   

Project Number: RMC   

County: Webb

Highway: IH 35, ETC. 

GENERAL NOTES: 

This contract becomes effective upon issuance of a Work Order by the Engineer and covers one 
(1) year.  Provide sufficient staff to concurrently pursue each contract in the event that additional
sweeping contracts are awarded to the same contractor.

Contractor questions on this project are to be addressed to the following individual(s):  

Rogelio Chapa, P.E. – Rogelio.Chapa@txdot.gov 
Irazema Cavazos – Irazema.Cavazos@txdot.gov 
Angel Alejo – Angel.Alejo@txdot.gov 

Questions may be submitted via the Letting Pre-Bid Q&A web page.  This webpage can be 
accessed from the Notice to Contractors dashboard located at the following Address: 

https://tableau.txdot.gov/views/ProjectInformationDashboard/NoticetoContractors 

All contractor questions will be reviewed by the Engineer. All questions and any corresponding 
responses that are generated will be posted through the same Letting Pre-Bid Q&A web page.   

The Letting Pre-Bid Q&A web page for each project can be accessed by using the dashboard to 
navigate to the project you are interested in by scrolling or filtering the dashboard using the 
controls on the left. Hover over the blue hyperlink for the project you want to view the Q&A for 
and click on the link in the window that pops up. 

Provide and maintain an e-mail address for receipt of Work Order and correspondence 
throughout the term of this contract. 

Repair and/or replace damaged rails, signposts, etc., caused by the Contractor’s actions during 
the performance of work.  Complete repairs within a time limit as determined by the Engineer. 

If agreed upon in writing by both parties to the contract, the contract may be extended for an 
additional period of time, not to exceed the original contract time period. The extended contract 
shall be for the original bid quantities, terms, and conditions, plus any approved applicable 
change orders. 

When the contract is extended by agreement, a performance and/or payment bond, if required, 
shall be executed in the amount of the extension before the additional work begins. 

Control:   

Project Number: RMC:

County: Webb

Highway: IH 35, ETC. 

SUPERVISION: 

The Engineer’s representative in charge of all work in this contract is the Maintenance 
Supervisor listed below.  The Pre-Work Meeting will be held at this location and all requests for 
payment are certified by this office. 

For this project, the Maintenance Supervisor in charge is: 

Webb County 
Jose Magana 
1817 Bob Bullock Loop 
Laredo, TX, 78043 
(956) 712-7714

Employees are required to wear proper safety equipment. Contractor is responsible for supplying 
proper safety equipment for employees. 

Work must commence within one week of Work Order letter to Contractor. Work per tract has to 
be completed in the number of days listed on the summary of tracts and quantities sheet (weather 
permitting) or less. Contractor must work continuously to complete items on tracts called out 
(with exception of Saturdays, Sundays, or National Holidays) unless approved by the 
Maintenance Supervisor. Approval by Maintenance Supervisor for non continued work on tracts 
does not relieve Contractor from completing work by original tract completion date.  

Liquidated damages will be assessed per work order(s) which exceed the total allocated 
workdays for tracts assigned on work order.  In the event that job performance is not to the 
satisfaction of the Engineer, sub marginal work is subject to special provision “Schedule of 
Liquidated Damages”. 

LIMITS: 

Cover the roadways and limits as shown on the plans. 

ITEM 8 PROSECUTION AND PROGRESS 

Roadway closures during the following key dates and/or special events are prohibited: January 1, 
Easter weekend, the last Monday in May, July 4, the first Monday in September, the fourth 
Thursday in November, and December 25 and Easter weekend. 

Working days will be computed and charged in accordance with Article 8.3.1.4 Calendar Day. 



Control:   
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Highway: IH 35, ETC. 

ITEM 502 BARRICADES, SIGNS AND TRAFFIC HANDLING: 

Designate, as the Contractor Responsible Person (CRP), an English-speaking employee on-call 
nights and weekends (or any other time that work is not in progress) with a local address and 
telephone number for maintenance of signs and barricades.  This employee will be located within 
one (1) hour of traveling time to the project site.  Notify the Engineer in writing of the name, 
address, and telephone number of this employee. Furnish traffic control devices that conform to 
all current “Traffic Control Plan Standards” (TCPS) and the current Texas Manual on Uniform 
Traffic Control Devices (MUTCD).  Provide a truck-mounted attenuator (TMA) for the shadow 
vehicle when sweeper is obstructing any portion of travel lane.  Leave one lane open for existing 
traffic.  Include trail and lead vehicles per traffic standards. 

ITEM 505 TRUCK MOUNTED ATTENUATOR (TMA) AND TRAILER: 

Provide 2 Truck Mounted Attenuator as required by the Engineer. Provide backup and always 
keep operational and available on the jobsite at all times during traffic control operations. The 
Truck Mounted Attenuator will be made available for the entire duration of the project, including 
all alternative locations.  

TCP 3 Series Scenario Required TMA 
(3-1)-13 All 2
(3-2)-13 All 3

ITEM 738 CLEANING AND SWEEPING HIGHWAYS 

Disposal of any collected debris at the local landfill is mandatory and no exceptions will be 
allowed. 

Provide a minimum of 2 fully operational sweepers during each scheduled working day for this 
contract. No exceptions will be considered without a written request. 

Loose aggregate accumulated by traffic barrier, raised medians, rail, etc. will be removed from 
the roadway. This work will be considered incidental To Item 738, “Cleaning and Sweeping 
Highways”. 



EST. FINAL
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