






ITEM 4: SCOPE OF WORK 

This contract includes non-site-specific work. Multiple concurrent work orders will 
be issued to procure work of the type identified in the contract at locations that have 
not yet been determined. For each repair, the Engineer will determine the work to be 
done and specify this on the work order issued to the Contractor. 

Provide a minimum of twenty-four (24) hour notice prior to performing work to the 
requesting Maintenance Section or appropriate contact person. Failure to provide 
prior notification may result in nonpayment of work performed. 

No lane closures on major roadways will be allowed during peak hours unless 
approved by Area Engineer. Peak hours are Monday through Friday between 7 am to 
9 am and 4 pm to 7 pm. 

Work Orders: 

Contractor shall be available to make repairs Monday through Friday. Begin work 
within three (3) working days after notification. If Contractor has not begun work 
within three (3) working days of notification, the Contractor will be charged 
liquidated damages at the rate set forth by this contract per day until the Contractor 
begins work. 

Work Orders Production Rates: 

Working Days allowed to complete each work order will be determined by dividing 
the total linear feet of cable required to complete the work order by the production 
rate of 74 posts per working day and/or 1000 LF of cable per working day. Cable 
median barrier terminal sections will be one (1) per working day. A fraction of a day 
will be rounded up to the nearest whole number. Working days not used on each 
work order will not be carried over. Working days for items other than what has 
been listed will be as determined by the Engineer. 

It is the Contractor's responsibility to determine and provide materials necessary to 
complete the defined scope of work within each work order and within the time 
allotment. 

ITEM 7: LEGAL RELATIONS AND RESPONSIBILITIES 

Restrict storage of equipment and materials to approved areas. The Engineer will not 
approve storage in any TxDOT yard. 

Dispose of waste generated from servicing equipment on the project properly. 

Existing utilities (public, private and TxDOT) are present throughout the project. 
Investigate to determine the utility locations and use caution when excavating in 
those areas. 

If access to the project is required through a new or unapproved driveway (i.e. 
Material sources stockpile location, field office, etc.), obtain an approved "Permit to 
Construct Access Driveway Facilities on Highway Right of Way" (TxDOT Form 
1058) before beginning any construction operations. 

ITEM 8: PROSECUTION AND PROGRESS 

Contract time charges shall begin upon issuance of "Authorization to Begin Work" 
letter. Three hundred and sixty-five (365) working days have been designated for 
this contract. Working days shall be computed and charged in accordance with 
Article 8.2 "Contract Term." 

Individual work order charge days shall run concurrently with contract time charges. 

The Engineer will give written notice to begin work. 

Once work has started, prosecute the work continuously to completion. If the 
Contractor begins work on the contract and leaves before work is completed, then 
liquidated damages will begin until the Contractor returns to work. Liquidated 
damages will be charged as stated in Special Provision 000-018 "Schedule of 
Liquidated Damages". 

ITEM 432: RIPRAP 

Removal of damaged concrete pad is subsidiary to Item 0432 7001. 

ITEM 500: MOBILIZATION 

One mobilization will be paid for per work order. Work orders will include no more 
than eight (8) locations per work order. 

GENERAL NOTES 

� 

� TM 

SHEET 2 OF 4 

I Texas Department of Transportation

@ 2024

FED. RD. 
MAINTENANCE PROJECT NO. I SHEET NO. 

DIV. NO. 

6 RMC 647386001 I 3B 
STATE DISTRICT COUNTY 

TEXAS ODA MIDLAND
9

ETC. 

CONTROL SECTION JOB I HIGHWAY NO. 

6473 86 001 I IH 20, ETC. 












































