






ITEM 502: BARRICADES, SIGNS, AND TRAFFIC HANDLING 

Furnish, place, and maintain all traffic control devices in accordance with the "Texas 
Manual on Uniform Traffic Control Devices" and traffic control standard sheets as 
specified herein, or as directed. 

Stop equipment for traffic when crossing any traffic lanes. Furnish certified flaggers 
to warn equipment operators of approaching traffic, unless otherwise directed. 
Certified Flaggers shall be equipped with an approved flagging vest and hard hat. 
They shall us a "SLOW-STOP" paddle in lieu of the standard flag. 

Relocate or remove temporary signs, as necessary. 

Remove or cover construction signs not in use. Do not lay down signs. 

The contractor will be responsible for continual monitoring of each location. 

Lane closures will be no more than (2) two miles long during working operations 
unless otherwise directed by the Engineer. 

ITEM 505: TRUCK MOUNTED ATTENUATORS (TMA): 

Work site is defined as the locations presented on the plans. 

The total number of truck mounted attenuators (TMA) required when utilizing the 
traffic control standard sheets are shown in the tables below. 

I I Scenario I Required TMA 
I 

TCP 3 Series 
(3-1 )-20 I All I 2 

Shadow vehicles equipped for truck mounted attenuators (TMA) for stationary 
operations will be paid for by the each and must be available for use at a time as 
determined by the Engineer. 

When TMAs are specified by the DAY, the unit of measure is for each day required 
by the contract. 

Therefore, (2) two shadow vehicles with TMA will be required for this type of work. 
The Contractor will be responsible for determining if one or more of these operations 
will be ongoing at the same time to determine the total number of TMA needed for 
the project for those times per plan requirements. Additional TMAs used that are not 
specified in the plans in which the Contractor expects compensation will require prior 
approval from the Engineer. 

Truck Mounted Attenuators (TMA) must be NCHRP 350 or MASH compliant and 
will require pre-approval by the Department. The supporting vehicle shall have a 
minimum gross (i.e. ballasted) vehicular weight of 20,000 +/- 1,000 pounds. 

I 
I 

ITEM 7022: PAVEMENT MARKING WATER CLEANING 

Use Medium Pressure (MP) water treatment equipment and remove dirt, oxidized 
paint, thermoplastic and hydrocarbon settlement from pavement markings to improve 
the retro-reflectivity. 

Furnish a water based detergent capable of loosening dirt, oxidized paint, 
thermoplastic, and hydrocarbon settlements. Restore the retro-reflectivity of the 
pavement marking without any damage to the pavement marking and pavement 
surface. 

Manage all collected wastewater, dirt, oxidized paint, thermoplastics, and other 
debris in accordance with Item 6.11., "Surplus Materials." 

This Item will be measured by the foot; by each word, symbol, or shape; or by any 
other unit shown on the plans. Each stripe will be measured separately. 

The work performed and materials furnished in accordance with this Item and 
measured as provided under "Measurement" will be paid for at the unit price bid for 
"Pavement Marking Cleaning" of the type specified. 
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