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GENERAL NOTES: 

Commence work within 72 hours of receiving a work order unless otherwise approved by the 
Engineer.  Failure to commence work within the specified time period or to work continuously 
until the work order has been completed will be cause to declare the contract in default.  
Exception from declaring default will be if the Contractor has obtained written permission from 
the Engineer prior to leaving the project.  In the event that all contract funds or 365 calendar days 
have been expended, the contract will be considered complete. 

This contract is to provide Signal Maintenance at various locations within the Lufkin District, 
which consists of the following nine counties:  Angelina, Houston, Nacogdoches, Polk, Sabine, 
San Augustine, San Jacinto, Shelby and Trinity. 

No lane closures will be allowed on US 59 after 12:00 PM (Noon) on Fridays or on days 
preceding Major Holidays, unless otherwise approved. 

Use approved safety and personal protection equipment (PPE) as directed.  Non-compliance with 
the Safety, Qualification and Certification requirements will be grounds for suspension of work. 

Maintenance needs and repairs will be provided to the Contractor by Lufkin Traffic Operations 
Office. 

Questions may be submitted via the Letting Pre-Bid Q&A web page.  This webpage can be 
accessed from the Notice to Contractors dashboard located at the following Address: 
https://tableau.txdot.gov/views/ProjectInformationDashboard/NoticetoContractors 

All contractor questions will be reviewed by the Engineer. All questions and any corresponding 
responses that are generated will be posted through the same Letting Pre-Bid Q&A web page.   

The Letting Pre-Bid Q&A web page for each project can be accessed by using the dashboard to 
navigate to the project you are interested in by scrolling or filtering the dashboard using the 
controls on the left. Hover over the blue hyperlink for the project you want to view the Q&A for 
and click on the link in the window that pops up. 

The contractor�s attention is directed to the EPIC sheet(s) included in this plan set for additional 
information regarding environmental permits, issues, and commitments.  

Item 4: Scope of Work 

The contract may be extended if in the judgment of the Engineer, the Contractor has 
satisfactorily fulfilled the terms and conditions of the contract.  The extension must be agreed 
upon in writing by both parties to the contract and may be extended for an additional period of 
time not to exceed the original contract time period.  The extended contract may be for additional 
quantities up to the original bid quantities plus any quantities added by an approved change 
order. The extensions will meet the terms and conditions of the original contract or any mutually 
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agreed modifications to the said terms and conditions by one or more cumulative change orders.  
The Engineer will set a deadline for completing the agreements.  This deadline will be based on 
the time needed to re-let and award a new contract if no extension is agreed upon.  

Item 5: Control of the Work 

Contact appropriate utility companies to locate underground utilities prior to drilling foundations, 
installing or removing underground conduits, or any other excavating.  Use care when working 
near utilities or existing storm sewers to prevent damage.  Use One-Call for locates. 

If unforeseen utility adjustments are encountered during construction operations, alter operations 
and continue to prosecute the contract in such a manner that will allow utility adjustments to be 
made by others.  An extension of working time may be granted for any delays caused by the 
utility adjustments, if deemed necessary. 

All litter within the project limits that may be deposited by construction operations or the 
traveling public will be collected and disposed of at the end of each workday, unless otherwise 
directed.  Do not dump or stockpile collected litter on State property.  Litter pickup will not be 
measured or paid for directly, but will be subsidiary to various bid items. 

Item 7:  Legal Relations and Responsibilities 

The proposed work of this project is to perform traffic signal maintenance at various locations 
throughout the Lufkin District. This activity maintains the original line and grade, hydraulic 
capacity and original purpose to the site.  Therefore, this project meets the definition of a routine 
maintenance activity as defined in the TPDES General Permit No. TXR150000 issued March 5, 
2023 and TCEQ�s TPDES CGP does not apply. 

Contractor to repair or replace in kind, at their own expense, any historic materials damaged 
(buildings, historical markers, etc.) in the course of executing the work. Contractor is responsible 
for locating replacement source for historic materials damaged in the course of the work. 
TxDOT-Environmental Affairs Division is to be informed of proposed repairs to facilitate 
consultation with Texas Historical Commission prior to execution of repairs. 

Item 421: Hydraulic Cement Concrete 

Curing facilities and strength testing equipment, for acceptance testing, will be provided at the 
District�s Signal Shop located in Lufkin at 1805 N. Timberland Drive. 
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Item 502: Barricades, Signs And Traffic Handling 

Traffic Control Plan (TCP): 

Furnish and maintain all required traffic control, warning signs, flaggers, channelizing devices, 
etc., in compliance with Item 502, the �Texas Manual on Uniform Traffic Control Devices�, 
applicable standards, and as directed, except for measurement and payment. 

In general, restrict construction work to single lane widths. Control traffic in accordance with 
standard drawings WZ (BTS-1) "Traffic Signal Installation Typical Details"; WZ (BTS-2) 
"Traffic Signal Installation Barricades And Signs"; and, Part VI of the "Texas Manual On 
Uniform Traffic Control Devices For Streets And Highways".  Unless otherwise approved, use 
an advance warning, flashing arrow panel in addition to the necessary signs, barricades, or other 
traffic control devices at the work area. 

Plan the sequence of work to minimize the time lane closures are in place.  Install lane closures 
only where construction operations are anticipated to start within 1 hour, unless otherwise 
directed or approved. 

All workers on TxDOT right-of-way must wear reflective clothing meeting ANSI Class II 
requirements during the day and ANSI Class III requirements during the night.   

Use additional flaggers at roadway intersections to direct traffic entering the work area, when 
deemed necessary by the Engineer. 

Provide adequate flaggers to protect the traveling public.  All flaggers shall wear approved 
hardhats and reflective vests while flagging.  Safety vests shall be clean and worn fully fastened. 

Open all traffic lanes to traffic at the close of work each day. 

No overnight closures will be permitted. 

Provide temporary Rumble Strips as shown on WZ (RS)-22. 

Provide one high-intensity yellow, rotating dome-light on all equipment such as drill truck, 
bucket truck, backhoes, etc.  Mount lights high enough to be visible from all directions and 
operating when the equipment is within 30 ft. of the travel way.  On all other equipment such as 
trucks, trailers, automobiles, etc. use emergency flashers while within the work zone. 

Notify the Engineer prior to placing any materials or equipment on the right of way.  Locate 
equipment, stockpiles or other materials not in use as far as possible from the driving lanes and 
in no case closer than 30 ft. unless otherwise authorized.  Any equipment, stockpiles, or 
materials placed within 30 ft. of the driving lane must have adequate signs, barricades or other 
warning devices as approved.  As a minimum place an 8 ft. wide TY III Barricade or barrels on 
the approach side of each site that is within 30 ft. of the driving lane.  Use TY III Barricade or 
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barrels for the site similarly on the departure side if the location is within 30 ft. of the opposing 
traffic lane. 

Item 506: Temporary Erosion, Sedimentation, and Environmental Controls 

Due to the limited soil disturbing nature of this project, temporary erosion control work has not 
been included.  Should this work become necessary, it will be paid for in accordance with Article 
4.4, "Changes in the Work". 

Item 531: Sidewalks 

Welded wire fabric will not be allowed for reinforcing sidewalks.  Use reinforcing steel 
consisting of No. 3 or 4 bars meeting the requirements of grade 60 reinforcing steel.  Place bars 
on 12 in. centers in each direction, supported on reinforcing chairs. 

Unless otherwise directed, install 1/2 in. pre-molded expansion joint material between existing 
concrete and new concrete. 

Item 618: Conduit 

Place conduit to a minimum depth of 3 ft., where obstructions prevent laying at this depth, place 
as directed. 

Where a trench for laying conduit is cut through pavement, surfaced shoulder, median or 
driveway, replace the base and surfacing with similar materials equal in appearance and quality 
to the original construction.  Replacing base and surfacing will be subsidiary to Item 618. 

Place conduit under existing pavement by boring unless otherwise directed.  Pits for boring must 
not be closer than 2 ft. from edge of pavement, unless otherwise approved.  Water jetting will not 
be permitted.  At the close of work each day, cover all open pits and barricade for safety. 

Use of a pneumatically driven device for punching holes beneath pavement (commonly known 
as a "missile") will not be permitted on this project. 

When boring is used for under-pavement conduit installations, maximum allowable overcut will 
be 1 in. diameter. 

When conduits are bored, vertical and horizontal tolerances must not exceed 18 inches as 
measured from the intended target point. 

All underground conduit bends of 45° or more in PVC conduit systems, including bends into 
ground boxes, will be made with rigid metal conduit.  Where rigid metal conduits is exposed at 
any point and where rigid metal conduits extends into ground boxes, bond the metal conduit to 
the grounding conduction with grounding type bushings or by other approved UL listed 
grounding connectors.  Rigid metal bends will not be paid for separately but will be incidental to 
the PVC conduit system. 
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Item 620: Electrical Conductors 

Provide breakaway electrical connectors for breakaway poles.  Use Bussman HEBW, Littlefuse 
LEB, Ferraz-Shawmut FEB, or equal on ungrounded conductors.  For grounded conductors, use 
Bussman Het, Littlefuse Let, Ferraz-Shawmut Febn, or equal.  These breakaway connectors have 
a white colored marking and a permanently installed solid neutral.  The splice must be a fused 
breakaway connector as described elsewhere in the plans, or as directed. 

Do not use non-certified persons to perform electrical work.  See Article 7.18., �Electrical 
Requirements� for additional details. 

Item 624: Ground Boxes 

Provide Type �C� Ground Boxes at Traffic Signal Controller foundations and Type �A� Ground 
Boxes for all other locations, unless otherwise directed or approved. 

Item 628: Electrical Services 

Comply with local standards and practices for proper installation of electrical service. Service 
entrance to be 2 AWG XHHW stranded copper. In addition to the TxDOT specified Ufer 
grounding, the electrical services must also include the grounding rods. Grounding wire shall be 
#6 gauge solid copper, run in ½� conduit from the service enclosure through the foundation to 
the grounding rod.   

Item 656: Foundations for Traffic Control Devices 

Consult with appropriate utilities before excavating for foundations, and take adequate 
precautions, by probing or uncovering by hand, to protect utilities or appurtenances.  Use One-
Call for locates.  

Foundations for Roadside Flashing Beacon Assemblies will be Screw-In Type unless otherwise 
directed. 

Item 680: Installation of Highway Traffic Signals 

If traffic signal maintenance becomes necessary to repair, replace or install a fully operational 
signalized intersection, ensure the existing traffic signal remains in full operation.  Existing 
traffic signal devices may be turned off only for brief periods of time to allow for installation of 
new devices.  Power may be turned off only during off-peak periods from 9:00 A.M. until 11:00 
A.M. and 1:00 P.M until 3:00 P.M.  Provide temporary signing, flaggers or additional traffic
control as directed, so that traffic can be moved through the intersection safely.

The Department will furnish the Traffic Signal Controller Assemblies for this project.  Furnish 
all other materials, tools, equipment and labor necessary to complete the work. 
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Install the Traffic Signal Controller Assembly on the foundation, using anchor bolts and template 
supplied by the Department.  Connect field wiring to the controller assembly back panel, install 
the conflict monitor, timer and other equipment, and turn on the signal system using settings 
supplied by the Department. 

Perform all necessary work to provide for a fully functioning traffic signal installation. 

Item 682: Vehicle and Pedestrian Signal Heads 

Cover all signal heads securely with burlap and keep covered until placed in operation. 

Provide necessary mounting hardware to insure proper mounting of all signal heads. 

Provide Articulating Brackets when required. 

Alternate signal head mounting hardware may be used when approved. 

Mount all signal heads so they hang level and plumb. 

Unless otherwise approved, use stainless steel hardware for all miscellaneous assembly items not 
specifically identified on the plans.  

Item 684: Traffic Signal Cables 

Furnish stranded No. 14 AWG XHHW and No. 16 AWG XHHW conductors. 

Identify each cable as shown in the plans (Cable 1, etc.) with permanent marking labels (Panduit 
Type PLM standard single marker tie, Thomas and Betts TY 548M, or equivalent) at each 
ground box, pole base and controller. 

Terminate all wiring from each signal head in the terminal block in the pole base where such 
terminal blocks are provided by the manufacturer.  Splice wire runs to signal poles with 
breakaway bases in the pole base.  The splice must be a fused breakaway connector as described 
elsewhere in the plans, or as directed.  Otherwise, wire runs must be continuous to the controller. 

No extra compensation will be allowed for fulfilling the requirements stated above. 

Furnish a written summary of the wire tests.  This summary must indicate a description of each 
wire run, length, and test readings for each test procedure.  Additional information such as make, 
model and type of testing equipment used for each test and the name and title of the individual 
who performed the tests must be included.  Certify the test results as being true and correct prior 
to submission to the Engineer.  Upon detection of a failed wire run test, forward documentation 
of the failed test to the Engineer and replace the wire run. 

Item 685: Roadside Flashing Beacon Assemblies 

Furnish and install flasher controller assemblies on service poles as directed or approved.  
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Flashing beacons shall be flashed alternately. 

Item 688: Pedestrian Detectors and Vehicle Loop Detectors 

Furnish new pedestrian signal units and materials and install as directed.  Equipment and 
materials must meet the requirements of DMS-11132, �Accessible Pedestrian Signals (APS)�.   
This equipment must be compatible with the controller assembly equipment and setup.  Do not 
order any equipment or materials and commence work for this installation without the approval 
of the Engineer. 

Item 690: Maintenance of Traffic Signals 

Unless otherwise directed, furnish all wood and steel poles required for this project. 

All existing material deemed unsalvageable will become the property of the Contractor and 
removed from the worksite and disposed of as outlined under Article 690.2., �Materials�, and 
pertinent requirements of various other items, unless otherwise directed or approved.   

Unless specifically identified and included as a pay item for �Removal�, unsalvageable material 
removed from the worksite will not be paid for separately. 

Return unused or removed salvageable material to the District�s Signal Shop located in Lufkin at 
1805 N. Timberland Drive, and stockpile as directed. 

Unless otherwise directed, when existing sod is disturbed, provide Bermuda block sod unless St. 
Augustine is the prevailing grass cover, and then provide St. Augustine block sod at those 
locations.  Fertilize sodded areas as directed. Water all newly placed sodded areas the same day 
of installation.  Continue to water these areas as directed, to prevent them from becoming dry to 
the condition that water stress is evident.  This work will not be measured or paid for separately, 
but is subsidiary to pertinent items in this contract. 

Item 6185: Truck Mounted Attenuator (TMA) and Trailer Attenuator (TA) 

Two (2) TMAs (Stationary) will be required for this project.  The contractor will be responsible 
for determining if multiple operations will be ongoing at the same time to determine the total 
number of TMAs needed for the project.   

Truck Mounted Attenuators (TMA�s) shall meet the requirements of this item and the 
Department�s Compliant Work Zone Traffic Control Device List.  

Truck Mounted Attenuators (TMA�s) as shown on the TCP�s shall be used. Whether shown on 
the TCP�s or added by the Department, TMA�s shall be paid for under Item 6185, �Truck 
Mounted Attenuator� for the type of operation being performed. 





























































































































ELECTRONIC RECORD AND SIGNATURE DISCLOSURE

Getting paper copies

Withdrawing your consent 

Consequences of changing your mind

All notices and disclosures will be sent to you electronically

How to contact Texas Department of Transportation:



To advise Texas Department of Transportation of your new e-mail address 

To request paper copies from Texas Department of Transportation

To withdraw your consent with Texas Department of Transportation

Required hardware and software



Acknowledging your access and consent to receive materials electronically


