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GENERAL NOTES: 

General:  

Plans may be obtained from one of the plan companies listed in the “Special Notice to Contractors”, or viewed 
at Texas Department of Transportation’s (TxDOT’s) Internet site at 

 https://www.txdot.gov/business/plans-online-bid-lettings.html 

Contractor questions on this project are to be addressed to the following individual(s): 
 
Vanessa Rosales-Herrera, P.E  Vanessa.Rosales@txdot.gov 

Contractor questions will be accepted through email by the above individuals. 

All contractor questions will be reviewed by the Engineer. Once a response is developed, it will be posted to 
TxDOT’s Public FTP at the following Address: 

Https://tableau.txdot.gov/views/ProjectInformationDashboard/NoticetoContractors  

All contractor questions will be reviewed by the Engineer. All questions and any corresponding responses that 
are generated will be posted through the same Letting Pre-Bid Q&A web page. 

The Letting Pre-Bid Q&A webpage for each project can be accessed by using the dashboard to navigate to the 
project you are interested in by scrolling or filtering the dashboard using the controls on the left. Hover over the 
blue hyperlink for the project you want to view the Q&A for and click on the link in the window that pops up. 

Project Description – This project shall consist of the purchase and delivery of Limestone Rock Asphalt, 
(Material Only), to TxDOT maintenance yards or specified locations within the Laredo District. Request for 
material will be made through independent work orders. 

ITEM 10.4: SCOPE OF WORK 

In Accordance with Article 10.4.3.1, this contract may be extended twice if mutually agreed. 

ITEM 10.8: PROSECUTION AND PROGRESS 

There are 182 calendar days on this contract. Calendar days will be charged in accordance with Article 10.8.2., 
“Contract Term”. 

Material requests shall be issued by work order. Each work order shall specify items, quantity, and location for 
material to be delivered.  
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Individual work order charge days shall run concurrently with contract time charges. 

In accordance with Article 8.6 “Failure to Complete Work on Time,” liquidated damages shall be charged each 
day for failure to deliver the material within the specified timeframe. For this contract, the vendor will have a 
maximum of 30 calendar days from the date of the work order to deliver the material. 

The amount assessed per day for liquidated damages shall be as specified in accordance with Special Provision 
000-658. 

Various bid items and their associated quantities have been provided within this Contract to establish bid prices 
for the proposed work. Actual work performed as directed will be paid utilizing these prices with no further 
compensation made regardless of the final quantities.  

ITEM 8040: LIMESTONE ROCK ASPHALT (MATERIALS ONLY) 

This is a contract for supplying Limestone Rock Asphalt material on an as needed basis. Refer to plan sheet 
page 4 Location Map for the proposed initial site locations, this may include other various locations within 
Dimmit County.  

For this contract the roadway maintenance supervisor in charge is: 

Dimmit County 

Juan D. Moreno 

2001 N. 1St. 

Carrizo Springs, TX 78834 

830-876-2535 

A 24-hour notice is required prior to delivery of the material. 

The maintenance supervisor will make the arrangement for the materials to be delivered. An email will be sent 
by the TxDOT Maintenance office to the vendor’s point of contact to verify the date and time of the order.  

The contractor is responsible for furnishing and delivering the Limestone Rock Asphalt to the County 
Maintenance yard or locations indicated in the above table. The delivery hours will be Monday through Friday 
for 7:00AM to 5:00PM. The maintenance section will stockpile the material.  
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