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General Notes

GENERAL NOTES: 

This Maintenance Contract is to provide for restoration of pavement markings throughout the 
Lufkin District, which consists of the following nine counties:  Angelina, Houston, 
Nacogdoches, Polk, Sabine, San Augustine, San Jacinto, Shelby and Trinity. 

Commence work within 7 days of receiving a work order unless otherwise approved.  Failure to 
commence work within the specified time period or to work continuously until the work order 
has been completed will be cause to declare the Contract in default.  Exception from declaring 
default will be if the Contractor has obtained written permission from the Engineer prior to 
leaving the project. In the event that all Contract funds or 365 calendar days have been expended, 
the Contract will be considered complete. 

All work must meet the minimum requirements of this Contract for a day and night inspection. 

Use approved safety and personal protection equipment (PPE) as directed.  Non-compliance with 
the Safety, Qualification and Certification requirements will be grounds for suspension of work. 

Provide proper equipment and labor to complete the initial list prior to leaving. 

Prior to beginning work, submit a schedule based on the list of highways so that inspection 
arrangements can be made.  The Contractor will be provided an initial list of highways at the pre-
construction meeting, indicating where pavement markings are to be placed. 

Work will be performed on weekdays, Monday thru Friday.  No work will be performed on 
weekends unless otherwise approved. 

In high traffic volume areas, work will not be allowed to begin before 9 A.M. and continued after 
4 P.M., unless otherwise approved.  In other areas, beginning and ending work times will be as 
directed or approved. 

No lane closures will be allowed on US 59 after 12:00 PM (Noon) on Fridays or on days 
preceding Major Holidays, unless otherwise approved. 

Furnish materials and make repairs to the existing roadway at any location that might be 
damaged by construction operations.  Perform this work in a manner satisfactory to the Engineer. 
This work will be considered subsidiary to various bid items. 

For questions concerning the plans contact Don Maddux at (936) 633-4353. 

Item 4: Scope of Work 

The Contract may be extended if in the judgment of the Engineer, the Contractor has 
satisfactorily fulfilled the terms and conditions of the Contract.  The extension must be agreed 
upon in writing by both parties to the Contract and may be extended for an additional period of 
time not to exceed the original Contract time period.  The extended Contract may be for 
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additional quantities up to the original bid quantities plus any quantities added by an approved 
change order.  The extensions must meet the terms and conditions of the original Contract or any 
mutually agreed modifications to the said terms and conditions by one or more cumulative 
change orders.  The Engineer will set a deadline for completing the agreements.  This deadline 
will be based on the time needed to re-let and award a new Contract if no extension is agreed 
upon.  

Item 7:  Legal Relations and Responsibilities 

The proposed work of this project is to Install Specialty Pavement Markings at various locations 
throughout the Lufkin District. This activity maintains the original line and grade, hydraulic 
capacity and original purpose of the site.   Therefore, this project meets the definition of a routine 
maintenance activity as defined in the TPDES General Permit No. TXR150000 issued March 5, 
2018 and TCEQ's TPDES CGP does not apply. 

Contractor to repair or replace in kind, at their own expense, any historic materials damaged 
(buildings, historical markers, etc) in the course of executing work. Contractor is responsible for 
locating replacement source for historical materials damaged in the course of the work.  TxDOT-
Environmental Affairs Division is to be informed of proposed repairs to facilitate consultation 
with Texas Historical Commission prior to the execution of repairs. 

There is critical habitat and/or populations of the following federally listed threatened and 
endangered species within the Lufkin District:   Texas golden gladecress, White bladder pod, 
Neches River Rose-mallow, Texas Prairie Dawn, Texas Trailing Phlox, Red-cockaded 
woodpecker and Louisiana Pinesnake. Consultation with the United States Fish and Wildlife 
Service has not been conducted with regard to these species. 

1. NO EQUIPMENT or VEHICLES shall leave the pavement and NO STOCKPILING or
EQUIPMENT STORAGE shall be allowed along the following roadways without prior
approval from the Area Engineer:   Angelina County- SH 63 Houston County- SH 7, FM 227,
FM 1733, FM 2781, FM 230;  Nacogdoches County- SH 21 Polk County- FM 1276 Sabine
County- SH 87, SH 21, FM 2343, FM 2426 San Augustine County- SH 21, SH 103, SH 147, FM
1992, FM 3483, FM 353 San Jacinto County - FM 2693, FM 1725, FM 945, FM 2025, FM 2666
Shelby County- FM 2261, FM 3184 Trinity County - SH 94, FM 2262, FM 357.

Item 9: Measurement and Payment 

This Contract includes callout work.  In accordance with Article 9.2., “Plans Quantity 
Measurement”, plans quantity measurement requirements are not applicable.  The quantities 
shown are for estimates only and payment will be based on the actual quantities placed. 
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Item 502: Barricades, Signs And Traffic Handling 

Traffic Control Plan (TCP): 

Furnish and maintain all warning signs, flaggers, channelizing devices, etc., required for Traffic 
Control on this project in accordance with Item 502, except for measurement and payment.  This 
work will not be paid for directly but will be subsidiary to pertinent items. 

Provide Traffic Control in accordance with TCP (2-2)-18, TCP (2-4)-18 and TCP (3-4)-13.  An 
arrow panel will be required. 

Use additional flaggers at roadway intersections to direct traffic entering the work area, when 
deemed necessary by the Engineer. All flaggers shall wear approved hardhats and reflective 
clothing. 

All workers on TxDOT right-of-way shall wear reflective clothing meeting ANSI Class II 
requirements during the day and ANSI Class III requirements during the night. 

Provide temporary Rumble Strips as shown on WZ(RS)-22 when lane closures are necessary. 

Blue warning lights should only be used while performing work on or near the travel lanes or 
shoulder where the traveling public may encounter workers that are not protected by a standard 
work zone set up such as a lane closure, shoulder closure, or one-way traffic control. 

Item 506: Temporary Erosion, Sedimentation, and Environmental Controls 

Due to the limited soil disturbing nature of this project, temporary erosion control work has not 
been included.  However, the SWP3 for this project shall consist of any erosion control or 
pollution control items deemed necessary by the Engineer.  Should this work become necessary, 
it will be paid for in accordance with Article 4.4, "Changes in the Work". 

Item 668: Prefabricated Pavement Markings 

Furnish all materials for this Contract in accordance with this Item. 

Perform all work during daylight hours and when weather conditions are suitable for the work. 

Item 6056: Preformed In-Lane (Transverse)/Centerline Rumble Strips  

Preformed In-Lane (Transverse) Rumble Strips shall be black. 

Item 6185: Truck Mounted Attenuator (TMA) 

One (1) TMA (Mobile Operation) will be required for this project.  The contractor will be 
responsible for determining if multiple operations will be ongoing at the same time to determine 
the total number of TMAs needed for the project.   
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Truck Mounted Attenuators (TMA’s) shall meet the requirements of this item and the 
Department’s Compliant Work Zone Traffic Control Device List.  

Truck Mounted Attenuators (TMA’s) as shown on the TCP’s shall be used. Whether shown on 
the TCP’s or added by the Department, TMA’s shall be paid for under Item 6185, “Truck 
Mounted Attenuator (Mobile Operation)”.   
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